

To: WISCONSIN CENTRAL GROUP
 C/O WCG - STEERING COMMITTEE
 DEWITT ROSS & STEVENS, S.C.
 2 E. MIFFLIN STREET, SUITE 600
 MADISON, WI 53703

Date: March 13, 2013
 Invoice: 948989
 Client: 71729.000

Re: CANADIAN NATIONAL

To Professional Services		Rate	Hours	Amount
John Duncan Varda				
02-06-13	NO CHARGE - WEDA presentation: find rail maps, forward to Martha S. Olson; organize presentation, forward to Martha S. Olson	0	1.50	0.00
02-07-13	NO CHARGE - WEDA presentation; Markup draft and forward; review changes, further edits; forward to M. Purtell at WEDA	0	1.10	0.00
02-08-13	NO CHARGE - WEDA preparation: at Madison Convention Center, event session on "crowd sourcing," and presentation and panel discussion; related travel	0	3.50	0.00
02-08-13	At Madison Club, working lunch, notes and questions for Watco conference call	0	1.10	0.00
02-08-13	NO CHARGE - At WEDA, discussion with R. Sense, Rep. Ribble, Great Lakes Forestry conference date	0	0.15	0.00
02-08-13	NO CHARGE - Preparatory notes; Watco conference call; telephone conference with B. Ridley, PCA; telephone conference with J. Culotta; notes	0	1.60	0.00
02-08-13	NO CHARGE - Checking line maps	0	0.20	0.00
02-09-13	NO CHARGE - Consider approach to case for State ownership of CN/WC northern Wisconsin light density lines	0	0.40	0.00
02-09-13	NO CHARGE - Northwoods: Draft statement on state ownership option	0	1.20	0.00
02-10-13	NO CHARGE - Northwoods: Draft cover letter for WMC to WisDOT regarding Watco proposal; email position statement and draft cover letter to J. Culotta	0	0.65	0.00
02-11-13	NO CHARGE - Note from T. Tisa regarding Intermodal and Log committee assignments; respond regarding second Great Lakes Forestry Conference	0	0.20	0.00
02-12-13	NO CHARGE - Email response to T. Tisa regarding Northern Lines position, development of state (transit commission) owned option; review note from Ashwini Rao, DATC	0	0.35	0.00

Date: March 13, 2013
 Invoice: 948989
 Client: 71729.000
 Page: 2

John Duncan Varda				
02-12-13	NO CHARGE - Northwoods Rail: Exchanges with R. Luce regarding Michigan counties membership; forward information on WisDOT contact	0	0.60	0.00
02-14-13	NO CHARGE - Northwoods: Telephone conference with S. Klinger, Tomahawk Rail, regarding CN proposal; email and telephone conference with B. Ridley disinterest in state ownership option; forward information to S. Klinger regarding WCG group position (10/15/2012)	0	1.25	0.00
02-15-13	Telephone conference with R. Adams regarding scope of loan and grant programs; email memo to t. Tisa regarding stopping intermodal trains, regarding CN participation in WisDOT loan and grant programs	0	1.25	0.00
02-15-13	NO CHARGE - Preparatory notes and, at DeWitt, telephone conference with T. Tisa regarding next steps; forward WRDC and intermodal "Quote of the Day;" forward information on China mission, exchange with T. Tisa; telephone conference with B. Zietlow regarding pellet project	0	1.70	0.00
02-15-13	Ashwini Rao, respond	0	0.15	0.00
02-18-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: Review and comment on J. Culotta draft of minutes	0	0.45	0.00
02-18-13	NO CHARGE - Review note from Attorney Mott, DOA SEO, regarding pellet industry meeting; email T. Tisa regarding someone from CN for the meeting; response	0	0.30	0.00
02-19-13	NO CHARGE - Follow up regarding Pellet Industry meeting at Rhinelander and DATCP China Wood Products Mission; scheduling, exchanges with T. Tisa and T. Lysiak; telephone conference with J. Culotta regarding same and Northwoods Rail meeting; telephone conference with M. Walsh, Genese & Wyoming	0	2.50	0.00
02-19-13	NO CHARGE - Forest products and export research	0	0.65	0.00
02-21-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: Note from T. Tisa regarding minutes	0	0.10	0.00
02-22-13	NO CHARGE - Northwoods Rail: Note from R. Luce regarding municipal agreement; check statute 66.0303; further email exchange	0	0.70	0.00
02-23-13	NO CHARGE - DATCP International Trade Team: Review email invitation from A. Rao, review background; accept invitation for Sheboygan, Rockline INdustries, 3/4/2013	0	0.35	0.00
02-25-13	NO CHARGE - Respond to L. Ogard regarding speaker from Green Bay Packaging for CSCMP Intermodal program at Green Bay; email M. DePrey regarding scheduling conference call	0	0.45	0.00

Date: March 13, 2013
 Invoice: 948989
 Client: 71729.000
 Page: 3

John Duncan Varda				
02-25-13	NO CHARGE - Extended telephone conference with J. Schneider, Johnsonville, (reference by Ashwini Rao) regarding LINKe presentation, shipper association concept, antitrust safe harbor, presentation; research Rockline and Johnsonville	0	0.75	0.00
02-25-13	NO CHARGE - Northwoods Rail: Email from R. Luce regarding Michigan connection on interstate agreement	0	0.20	0.00
02-25-13	NO CHARGE - Northwoods Rail: Telephone conference with J. Landru regarding status, WCGroup position	0	0.35	0.00
02-25-13	NO CHARGE - Intermodal: Message regarding Green Bay event and follow-up on background; calendar	0	0.30	0.00
02-26-13	NO CHARGE - Log Project: Email Ashwini Rao regarding help on third-party export processing raw forest products	0	0.65	0.00
02-26-13	NO CHARGE - Log Project: Multiple exchanges with Attorney Mott regarding pellet industry event, 4/18/2013; consider further development	0	0.85	0.00
02-26-13	NO CHARGE - Work up Project Committee ideas; notes for telephone conference with M. DePrey; memo to T. Tisa regarding schedule and options	0	2.80	0.00
02-27-13	NO CHARGE - Review T. Tisa email comments, respond regarding query on "team leader" and advice on LINKe meeting; email M. DePrey regarding conference call; email A. Rao regarding CN possible CN participation at LINKe meeting, March 4; telephone conference with J. Culotta, briefing and assignments; response from A. Rao regarding LINKe meeting	0	1.30	0.00
02-27-13	NO CHARGE - Intermodal Project: Telephone conference with L. Ogard regarding CSCMP Green Bay, 4/3/2013	0	0.20	0.00
02-27-13	NO CHARGE - Instructions regarding rosters for Log and Intermodal Committees	0	0.25	0.00
02-27-13	NO CHARGE - Advisory Board: Note to C. Smith regarding working committee appointments; multiple attempts to contact M. DePrey	0	0.30	0.00
02-27-13	NO CHARGE - Advice from J. Culotta regarding legislative contacts; telephone conference with L. Ogard regarding CSCMP Green Bay 4/3/2013	0	0.35	0.00
02-28-13	NO CHARGE - Review Secretary Gottlieb's response to K. Bauer regarding Watco; consider contact with Watco; further regarding Committee rosters	0	0.30	0.00
02-28-13	NO CHARGE - LINKe presentation edit and print instructions, antitrust guideline sample; confirmation of numbers, A. Rao	0	0.55	0.00
02-28-13	NO CHARGE - Intermodal Export: Review note from A. Rao, help on fumigation, etc.; check links; reply	0	0.30	0.00

Date: March 13, 2013
 Invoice: 948989
 Client: 71729.000
 Page: 4

Total Current Professional Services	0	31.85	0.00
-------------------------------------	---	-------	------

Total Current Services and Disbursements			<u>0.00</u>
Balance Outstanding on this Matter as of 03-13-13			<u>6,640.25</u>
TOTAL DUE, PLEASE PAY THIS AMOUNT			<u>6,640.25</u>
RE: CANADIAN NATIONAL			<u><u> </u></u>

Trust Account Activity for this Invoice

Trust Account Balance as of 03-13-13	13,000.00
Application of Trust to Balance Due on Account	<u>0.00</u>
Balance Remaining in Trust as of 03-13-13	13,000.00